
MOHAMMED HAMAD ABDELLAH HINETEER 

00966557313631 - 00966595027051 

muhamedhineteer@gmail.com 

OBJECTIVE  

 Looking for a challenging and demanding position in a growth 
oriented Building services Consulting/Contracting organization to 
render professional skills and contribute to attain organizational 
growth and objectives 

WORK EXPERIENCE 

Alwadie for safety Est.- Saudi Arabia Jeddah from Sep 

2016 up to date 

As mechanical engineer 

 Worked in a firefighting projects: Involved in a several both 

(maintenance and installation) projects such as villas, commercial 

complexes, schools and residential buildings.                   

Duties and responsibilities:- 

•Overseeing all mechanical works related to building services 
such as, Fire Fighting system, 

● Daily responsibilities involved supervising progress of installing 
mechanical works, preparing daily / weekly work planes reporting 
directly to project manager. 

● Implementing firefighting projects in schools as ministry of 
education contractor in KSA 

● Implementing firefighting projects in hospitals include beside the 
water system the gas system 
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White Nile sugar co:            from nov2014 to  may 2016 

As mechanical engineer 

Sugar production co  

Duties: 

Supervise the maintenance of harvesters, trucks, equipments and 
facilities in the workshop for services and seasonal maintenance, 
and at the field to follow up quick maintenance for the harvesters 
and trucks 

Creation contracting co. Sudan   from jun2011 to 

nov2014 

As mechanical engineer 

Duties: 

Follow up the service and maintenance of generators (perkins) 
during warranty of the company period 

After sell maintenance services  

 

TEARFUND (NGO)                             from jun2009 to 

jun2011 

As mechanical engineer 

Duties: 

Install submersible pumps and generators in the villages and 
rehabilitate water yards 

Services and maintenance of the generators and pumps during 
the (NGO) period 



Train the technicians how to operate and maintain the generators 
and pumps 

MCAVs ( UN contractor)        from sep2006 to jun2009 

As assistant engineer 

Duties: 

Maintain and service the APCs (armored personnel carrier ) to be 
ready for duties in UN camps  

Order parts for the faulty APCs  

Daily report for the status of the APCs   

Solidarites (NGO)                    from apr2006 to sep2006 

As mechanical engineer 

Duties: 

Install submersible pumps and generators in the villages and 
rehabilitate water yards 

Services and maintenance of the generators and pumps during 
the (NGO) period 

Train the technicians how to operate and maintain the generators 
and pumps 

 

 

 

 

EDUCATION: 

● B.SC  of mechanical engineering –Red Sea  unvirsitay2002 



 

TRAINGING & COURSES 

Firefighting course jun2016 to jul2016 

Autocad 3D jul2016 to aug2016 

Diesel generators Aug 2011 to sep2011 

Water analysis database apr 2010 to may 2010 

Danfodio for contracting, roads and bridges co 2005 

 

LANGUAGES& SKILLS  

● Computer Skills: M office & AutoCAD 

● Arabic: native 

●  ,English : fluent  

Personal skills: 

• Proficiency of computer.   

• Ability to deal with clients.  

• Ability to acquire experiences in the field of work.  

• Ability to achieve the desired goals.  

 

● OTHERS: 
 

● Registered in Saudi Council of Engineers. 

● Hold a valid transferrable  Iqama in KSA. 

● Hold a valid driving license KSA.  

REFERENCES 



Available upon request 

 


